

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Item	Description	Catalog Price	Discounted Price	Catalog Price	Discounted Price
SECTION 1 - 3M		Alternate Award		Secondary Award	
1	Weatherstrip Adhesive, 03602, 1 oz, Single Canister, 03602	\$ 8.34	\$ 3.75	\$ 7.42	\$ 3.71
2	General Adhesive Cleaner, 1 qt, Single Canister, 08984	\$ 52.47	\$ 23.61	\$ 45.32	\$ 22.66
Section Total		\$ 27.36		\$ 26.37	
Discount From List Price		55.00%		50.00%	
Price Sheet Used		Parts Authority Price List		Catalog Price	
Warranty		Manufacturer		Manufacturer	
SECTION 2 - AC DELCO				Primary Award	
1	Alternator Bolt, 11611102	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.38	\$ 2.38
2	Starter Motor, 12695760	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 144.51	\$ 144.51
3	Starter Motor, 12695760	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 144.51	\$ 144.51
4	Fuel Injection Fuel Rail, 12707882	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 95.05	\$ 95.05
5	Ignition Coil, 12708496	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 77.08	\$ 77.08
6	Mass Airflow Sensor, 12714453	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.27	\$ 41.27
7	Alternator, 13534128	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 147.76	\$ 147.76
8	Rear Brake Rotor, 13542117	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 88.33	\$ 88.33
9	Ambient Air Temperature Sensor, 13583411	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.16	\$ 7.16
10	Air Conditioning Compressor Hose Seal, 15-34783	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.42	\$ 2.42
11	Air Conditioning Compressor Clutch Kit, 15-40545	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 117.83	\$ 117.83
12	Air Conditioning Condenser, 15-63889	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 131.27	\$ 131.27
13	Engine Cooling Fan Blade, 15-81793	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 265.58	\$ 265.58
14	Semi-Metallic Rear Disc Brake Pad Set, 17D1400MH	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 75.75	\$ 75.75
15	Steering Column, 23329703	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 136.08	\$ 136.08
16	Engine Water Pump with Gasket, 251-821	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.28	\$ 76.28

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Item	Description	Catalog Price	Discounted Price	Catalog Price	Discounted Price
SECTION 1 - 3M					
1	Weatherstrip Adhesive, 03602, 1 oz, Single Canister, 03602	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	General Adhesive Cleaner, 1 qt, Single Canister, 08984	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 2 - AC DELCO					
1	Alternator Bolt, 11611102	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Starter Motor, 12695760	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Starter Motor, 12695760	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Fuel Injection Fuel Rail, 12707882	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Ignition Coil, 12708496	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Mass Airflow Sensor, 12714453	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Alternator, 13534128	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Rear Brake Rotor, 13542117	\$ 194.33	\$ 136.03	No Bid	No Bid
9	Ambient Air Temperature Sensor, 13583411	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Air Conditioning Compressor Hose Seal, 15-34783	\$ 238.74	\$ 167.12	No Bid	No Bid
11	Air Conditioning Compressor Clutch Kit, 15-40545	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Air Conditioning Condenser, 15-63889	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Engine Cooling Fan Blade, 15-81793	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Semi-Metallic Rear Disc Brake Pad Set, 17D1400MH	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Steering Column, 23329703	\$ 238.74	\$ 167.12	No Bid	No Bid
16	Engine Water Pump with Gasket, 251-821	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Item	Description	Catalog Price	Discounted Price	Catalog Price	Discounted Price
SECTION 1 - 3M		<b>Primary Award</b>			
1	Weatherstrip Adhesive, 03602, 1 oz, Single Canister, 03602	\$ 9.16	\$ 4.58	\$ 8.37	\$ 4.18
2	General Adhesive Cleaner, 1 qt, Single Canister, 08984	\$ 59.32	\$ 29.66	\$ 42.43	\$ 20.21
Section Total		\$ 34.24		\$ 24.39	
Discount From List Price		50.00%		50.00%	
Price Sheet Used		Napa		3M Price List	
Warranty		No Bid		No Warranty	
SECTION 2 - AC DELCO		<i>Secondary Award</i>			
1	Alternator Bolt, 11611102	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.38	\$ 2.38
2	Starter Motor, 12695760	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 144.51	\$ 144.51
3	Starter Motor, 12695760	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 144.51	\$ 144.51
4	Fuel Injection Fuel Rail, 12707882	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 95.05	\$ 95.05
5	Ignition Coil, 12708496	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 77.08	\$ 77.08
6	Mass Airflow Sensor, 12714453	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.27	\$ 41.27
7	Alternator, 13534128	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 147.76	\$ 147.76
8	Rear Brake Rotor, 13542117	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 97.16	\$ 97.16
9	Ambient Air Temperature Sensor, 13583411	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.16	\$ 7.16
10	Air Conditioning Compressor Hose Seal, 15-34783	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.42	\$ 2.42
11	Air Conditioning Compressor Clutch Kit, 15-40545	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 117.83	\$ 117.83
12	Air Conditioning Condenser, 15-63889	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 144.40	\$ 144.40
13	Engine Cooling Fan Blade, 15-81793	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 265.58	\$ 265.58
14	Semi-Metallic Rear Disc Brake Pad Set, 17D1400MH	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 75.75	\$ 75.75
15	Steering Column, 23329703	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 136.08	\$ 136.08
16	Engine Water Pump with Gasket, 251-821	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.28	\$ 76.28

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
17	Alternator, 25877026	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 284.12	\$ 284.12
18	Alternator, 84143540	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 300.41	\$ 300.41
19	Engine Cooling Fan Motor, 84580367	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 121.36	\$ 121.36
20	Front Driver Side Upper Control Arm, 84646948	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.73	\$ 70.73
21	Front Passenger Side Upper Control Arm, 84646950	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.73	\$ 70.73
22	Front Disc Brake Rotor, 84865905	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 65.65	\$ 65.65
23	Front Wheel Bearing and Hub Assembly, 84869190	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 158.98	\$ 158.98
24	Battery, 96RG	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00
25	Air Filter, A3228C	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.32	\$ 18.32
26	Ignition Coil, D510C	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 78.31	\$ 78.31
27	Engine Oil Filter, PF63	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.96	\$ 4.96
28	Fuel Filter Kit, TP3018	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 39.69	\$ 39.69
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 2,866.52	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		0.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Catalog Price	
Warranty		No Bid		Manufacturer	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
17	Alternator, 25877026	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Alternator, 84143540	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Engine Cooling Fan Motor, 84580367	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	Front Driver Side Upper Control Arm, 84646948	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Front Passenger Side Upper Control Arm, 84646950	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22	Front Disc Brake Rotor, 84865905	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Front Wheel Bearing and Hub Assembly, 84869190	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Battery, 96RG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25	Air Filter, A3228C	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26	Ignition Coil, D510C	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Engine Oil Filter, PF63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28	Fuel Filter Kit, TP3018	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		\$ 470.27		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		30.00%		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		Catalog Price		No Bid	
Warranty		Manufacturer		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
17	Alternator, 25877026	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 284.12	\$ 284.12
18	Alternator, 84143540	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 300.41	\$ 300.41
19	Engine Cooling Fan Motor, 84580367	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 121.36	\$ 121.36
20	Front Driver Side Upper Control Arm, 84646948	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.73	\$ 70.73
21	Front Passenger Side Upper Control Arm, 84646950	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.73	\$ 70.73
22	Front Disc Brake Rotor, 84865905	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.25	\$ 70.25
23	Front Wheel Bearing and Hub Assembly, 84869190	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 158.98	\$ 158.98
24	Battery, 96RG	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 92.57	\$ 92.57
25	Air Filter, A3228C	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.32	\$ 18.32
26	Ignition Coil, D510C	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 78.31	\$ 78.31
27	Engine Oil Filter, PF63	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.96	\$ 4.96
28	Fuel Filter Kit, TP3018	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 39.69	\$ 39.69
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 2,885.65	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		0.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		AC Delco	
Warranty		No Bid		Manufacturer	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 3 - BALDWIN					
1	Lube Oil Filter, P40033	\$ 18.60	\$ 7.44	No Bid	No Bid
2	Cabin Air Panel Filter, PA10440	\$ 60.54	\$ 24.22	No Bid	No Bid
3	Engine Air Panel, PA4321	\$ 31.62	\$ 12.65	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		\$ 44.31		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		60.00%		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		Parts Authority Price List		No Bid	
Warranty		Manufacturer		No Bid	
SECTION 4 - CRC				<b>Primary Award</b>	
1	Electronic Cleaner, 11 oz, Single Canister, 05103	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.83	\$ 7.19
2	Battery Cleaner, 7.5 oz., Single Canister, 05723	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.14	\$ 3.19
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 10.38	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		48.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Catalog Price	
Warranty		No Bid		Manufacturer	
SECTION 5 - FRAM					
1	Air Filter, CA12404	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Oil Filter, PH10575	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Oil Filter, FF10575	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 6 - GATES		<b>Primary Award</b>		<i>Secondary Award</i>	
1	Micro-V Serpentine Drive Belt, K060448	\$ 44.83	\$ 13.45	\$ 44.83	\$ 15.69

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 3 - BALDWIN					
1	Lube Oil Filter, P40033	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Cabin Air Panel Filter, PA10440	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Engine Air Panel, PA4321	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 4 - CRC					
1	Electronic Cleaner, 11 oz, Single Canister, 05103	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Battery Cleaner, 7.5 oz., Single Canister, 05723	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 5 - FRAM					
1	Air Filter, CA12404	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Oil Filter, PH10575	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Oil Filter, FF10575	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 6 - GATES					
1	Micro-V Serpentine Drive Belt, K060448	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid



RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 3 - BALDWIN				<b>Primary Award</b>	
1	Lube Oil Filter, P40033	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 34.85	\$ 6.97
2	Cabin Air Panel Filter, PA10440	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 74.70	\$ 14.94
3	Engine Air Panel, PA4321	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 42.33	\$ 8.47
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 30.38	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		80.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Baldwin	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 4 - CRC		<i>Secondary Award</i>			
1	Electronic Cleaner, 11 oz, Single Canister, 05103	\$ 22.26	\$ 8.90	No Bid	No Bid
2	Battery Cleaner, 7.5 oz., Single Canister, 05723	\$ 10.52	\$ 4.21	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		\$ 13.11		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		60.00%		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		Napa		No Bid	
Warranty		2 Year		No Bid	
SECTION 5 - FRAM					
1	Air Filter, CA12404	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Oil Filter, PH10575	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Oil Filter, FF10575	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 6 - GATES				<b>Alternate Award</b>	
1	Micro-V Serpentine Drive Belt, K060448	\$ 36.14	\$ 19.88	\$ 39.17	\$ 14.88

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
2	Micro-V Serpentine Belt, K060714	\$ 51.48	\$ 15.44	\$ 51.48	\$ 18.02
Section Total		\$ 28.89		\$ 33.71	
Discount From List Price		70.00%		65.00%	
Price Sheet Used		Parts Authority Price List		Catalog Price	
Warranty		Manufacturer		Manufacturer	
SECTION 7 - INTERSTATE					
1	Battery, MTP-48H6	\$ 316.32	\$ 85.41	No Bid	No Bid
2	Battery, MTP-78DT	\$ 307.48	\$ 83.02	No Bid	No Bid
3	Battery, MTP-94RH7	\$ 708.95	\$ 191.42	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		\$ 359.85		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		73.00%		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		Parts Authority Price List		No Bid	
Warranty		Manufacturer		No Bid	
SECTION 8 - LUCAS					
				<b>Primary Award</b>	
1	Oil Stabilizer, 32 oz, Single Container, 10001	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.49	\$ 9.89
2	Power Steering Stop Leak, 12 oz, 10008	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.99	\$ 8.69
3	Transmission Fix Stop Leak, 24 oz, 10009	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.99	\$ 10.79
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 29.37	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		40.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Catalog Price	
Warranty		No Bid		Manufacturer	
SECTION 9 - MOOG					
				<b>Primary Award</b>	
1	Front Lower Ball Joint, K90332	\$ 44.88	\$ 17.95	\$ 94.47	\$ 32.12
2	Rear Wheel Bearing and Hub Assembly, 512587	\$ 339.53	\$ 135.81	\$ 435.70	\$ 148.14
Section Total		\$ 153.76		\$ 180.26	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
2	Micro-V Serpentine Belt, K060714	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 7 - INTERSTATE					
1	Battery, MTP-48H6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Battery, MTP-78DT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Battery, MTP-94RH7	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 8 - LUCAS					
1	Oil Stabilizer, 32 oz, Single Container, 10001	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Power Steering Stop Leak, 12 oz, 10008	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Transmission Fix Stop Leak, 24 oz, 10009	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 9 - MOOG					
1	Front Lower Ball Joint, K90332	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Rear Wheel Bearing and Hub Assembly, 512587	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
2	Micro-V Serpentine Belt, K060714	\$ 41.56	\$ 22.86	\$ 46.22	\$ 17.56
Section Total		\$ 42.74		\$ 32.44	
Discount From List Price		45.00%		62.00%	
Price Sheet Used		Napa		Gates	
Warranty		Limited		No Bid	
SECTION 7 - INTERSTATE					
1	Battery, MTP-48H6	\$ 237.23	\$ 130.48	No Bid	No Bid
2	Battery, MTP-78DT	\$ 239.22	\$ 131.57	No Bid	No Bid
3	Battery, MTP-94RH7	\$ 262.37	\$ 144.30	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		\$ 406.35		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		45.00%		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		Napa		No Bid	
Warranty		2 Year		No Bid	
SECTION 8 - LUCAS		Alternate Award		Secondary Award	
1	Oil Stabilizer, 32 oz, Single Container, 10001	\$ 30.78	\$ 15.39	\$ 28.19	\$ 12.69
2	Power Steering Stop Leak, 12 oz, 10008	\$ 26.12	\$ 13.06	\$ 21.89	\$ 9.85
3	Transmission Fix Stop Leak, 24 oz, 10009	\$ 30.84	\$ 15.42	\$ 28.19	\$ 12.69
Section Total		\$ 43.87		\$ 35.23	
Discount From List Price		50.00%		55.00%	
Price Sheet Used		Napa		Lucas	
Warranty		No Warranty		No Warranty	
SECTION 9 - MOOG					
1	Front Lower Ball Joint, K90332	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Rear Wheel Bearing and Hub Assembly, 512587	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Discount From List Price		60.00%		<b>66.00%</b>	
Price Sheet Used		Parts Authority Price List		<b>Catalog Price</b>	
Warranty		Manufacturer		<b>Manufacturer</b>	
SECTION 10 - MOPAR					
1	Radiator Outlet Hose, 68184897AD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Radiator Inlet Hose, 68184908AC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Fan Drive, 68359842AD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 11 - MOTORCRAFT				<b>Primary Award</b>	
1	Brake Pads, BRF-1383	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.99	\$ 47.49
2	Brake Pads, BRF-1467	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.99	\$ 47.49
3	Brake Pads, BRF-1475	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 77.80	\$ 73.91
9	Brake Pads, BRF-1903	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 71.90	\$ 68.31
10	Brake Pads, BRF-1922	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 91.90	\$ 87.31
11	Rear Brake Rotor, BRRF-403	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 62.10	\$ 59.00
12	Front Disc Brake Rotor, BRRF-406	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.70	\$ 67.17
13	Rear Wheel Seal, BRS118	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.52	\$ 7.14
14	Battery, BXL59	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 87.96	\$ 83.56
16	Battery, BXT65-750	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 111.96	\$ 106.36
17	Air Filter, FA-1884	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 12.51
18	Air Filter, FA-1890	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 12.51
19	Air Filter, FA-1900	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 12.51

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 10 - MOPAR					
1	Radiator Outlet Hose, 68184897AD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Radiator Inlet Hose, 68184908AC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Fan Drive, 68359842AD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 11 - MOTORCRAFT				Alternate Award	
1	Brake Pads, BRF-1383	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 91.65	\$ 64.15
2	Brake Pads, BRF-1467	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 91.65	\$ 64.15
3	Brake Pads, BRF-1475	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 129.67	\$ 90.76
9	Brake Pads, BRF-1903	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 97.17	\$ 68.01
10	Brake Pads, BRF-1922	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 124.17	\$ 86.91
11	Rear Brake Rotor, BRRF-403	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 103.50	\$ 72.45
12	Front Disc Brake Rotor, BRRF-406	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 101.67	\$ 71.16
13	Rear Wheel Seal, BRS118	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.42	\$ 8.69
14	Battery, BXL59	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 119.95	\$ 83.96
16	Battery, BXT65-750	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 149.95	\$ 104.96
17	Air Filter, FA-1884	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.95	\$ 16.76
18	Air Filter, FA-1890	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.95	\$ 16.76
19	Air Filter, FA-1900	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.95	\$ 16.76

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 10 - MOPAR				<b>Primary Award</b>	
1	Radiator Outlet Hose, 68184897AD	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.25	\$ 57.19
2	Radiator Inlet Hose, 68184908AC	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 52.50
3	Fan Drive, 68359842AD	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 412.00	\$ 309.00
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 418.69	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		25.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		<b>Mopar</b>	
Warranty		No Bid		<b>Manufacturer</b>	
SECTION 11 - MOTORCRAFT				<i>Secondary Award</i>	
1	Brake Pads, BRF-1383	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 65.99	\$ 65.99
2	Brake Pads, BRF-1467	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 65.99	\$ 65.99
3	Brake Pads, BRF-1475	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 93.36	\$ 93.36
9	Brake Pads, BRF-1903	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 96.96	\$ 96.96
10	Brake Pads, BRF-1922	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 89.40	\$ 89.40
11	Rear Brake Rotor, BRRF-403	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 74.52	\$ 74.52
12	Front Disc Brake Rotor, BRRF-406	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 73.20	\$ 73.20
13	Rear Wheel Seal, BRS118	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.83	\$ 6.83
14	Battery, BXL59	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 95.96	\$ 95.96
16	Battery, BXT65-750	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 119.96	\$ 119.96
17	Air Filter, FA-1884	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 13.17
18	Air Filter, FA-1890	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 13.17
19	Air Filter, FA-1900	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 13.17

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
20	Air Filter, FA-1908	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 12.51
21	Air Filter, FA-1947	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 12.51
22	Fuel Filter, FD-4596	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27.60	\$ 26.22
23	Fuel Filter, FD-4615	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 65.68	\$ 62.40
24	Fuel Filter, FD-4616	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.99	\$ 43.69
25	Fuel Filter, FD-4617	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.99	\$ 43.69
27	Oil Filter, FL-1A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.75	\$ 7.36
28	Oil Filter, FL-2016	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.66	\$ 16.78
29	Oil Filter, FL-820S	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.28
30	Alternator, GL-671	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 165.00	\$ 156.75
31	Alternator, GL8825	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 262.00	\$ 248.90
32	Alternator, GL8858	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 191.00	\$ 181.45
33	Alternator, GL8969	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 274.00	\$ 260.30
36	Ignition Coil, DG508	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.70	\$ 32.02
37	Ignition Coil, DG511	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 35.60	\$ 33.82
38	Ignition Coil, DG520	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 66.80	\$ 63.46
39	Ignition Coil, DG541	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.80	\$ 48.26
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 1,939.67	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		5.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Catalog Price	
Warranty		No Bid		Manufacturer	
SECTION 12 - OEM DODGE					
1	Axle Housing, 68217031AC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	EGR Valve, 4627465AG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Blower Motor Resistor, 68048900AA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid



RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
20	Air Filter, FA-1908	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.95	\$ 16.76
21	Air Filter, FA-1947	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.95	\$ 16.76
22	Fuel Filter, FD-4596	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.18	\$ 35.12
23	Fuel Filter, FD-4615	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 119.42	\$ 83.59
24	Fuel Filter, FD-4616	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 83.62	\$ 58.53
25	Fuel Filter, FD-4617	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 83.62	\$ 58.53
27	Oil Filter, FL-1A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.09	\$ 9.86
28	Oil Filter, FL-2016	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.11	\$ 22.47
29	Oil Filter, FL-820S	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.18	\$ 5.72
30	Alternator, GL-671	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 365.45	\$ 255.81
31	Alternator, GL8825	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 600.00	\$ 420.00
32	Alternator, GL8858	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 378.18	\$ 264.72
33	Alternator, GL8969	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 516.36	\$ 361.45
36	Ignition Coil, DG508	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 61.27	\$ 42.88
37	Ignition Coil, DG511	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 64.73	\$ 45.31
38	Ignition Coil, DG520	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 121.45	\$ 85.01
39	Ignition Coil, DG541	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 92.36	\$ 64.65
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 2,612.65	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		30.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Fordparts.com	
Warranty		No Bid		2 Year	
SECTION 12 - OEM DODGE					
1	Axle Housing, 68217031AC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	EGR Valve, 4627465AG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Blower Motor Resistor, 68048900AA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
20	Air Filter, FA-1908	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 13.17
21	Air Filter, FA-1947	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.17	\$ 13.17
22	Fuel Filter, FD-4596	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27.60	\$ 27.60
23	Fuel Filter, FD-4615	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 65.68	\$ 65.68
24	Fuel Filter, FD-4616	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.99	\$ 45.99
25	Fuel Filter, FD-4617	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.99	\$ 45.99
27	Oil Filter, FL-1A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.75	\$ 7.75
28	Oil Filter, FL-2016	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.66	\$ 17.66
29	Oil Filter, FL-820S	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.50
30	Alternator, GL-671	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 241.20	\$ 241.20
31	Alternator, GL8825	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 396.00	\$ 396.00
32	Alternator, GL8858	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 249.60	\$ 249.60
33	Alternator, GL8969	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 340.80	\$ 340.80
36	Ignition Coil, DG508	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 40.44	\$ 40.44
37	Ignition Coil, DG511	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 42.72	\$ 42.72
38	Ignition Coil, DG520	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 80.16	\$ 80.16
39	Ignition Coil, DG541	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 60.96	\$ 60.96
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 2,515.07	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		0.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Motorcraft	
Warranty		No Bid		2 Year Limited	
SECTION 12 - OEM DODGE					
1	Axle Housing, 68217031AC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	EGR Valve, 4627465AG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Blower Motor Resistor, 68048900AA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
4	Actuator, 68448026AA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
4	Actuator, 68448026AA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
4	Actuator, 68448026AA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 13 - OEM FORD					
1	Door Assembly Rear, LB5Z-7824630-B	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Pillar Molding, Right, LB5Z-7803144-AA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Bumper Cover, LB5Z-17D957AAPT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Window Regulator Right, LB5Z-5827008-A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 14 - OEM GENERAL MOTORS					
1	Engine Cooling Fan Shroud, 84120130	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Rear Upper Bumper Cover, 84803239	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Hood, 85112715	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 15 - OEM HONDA					
1	Starter Motor Assembly, 31200-PLR-A02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Throttle Body Electronic Control, 16400-59B-003	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Blower Sub Assembly, 79305-TBA-A11	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Wire Harness, Driver Door, 32751-TGG-A10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 13 - OEM FORD				<b>Primary Award</b>	
1	Door Assembly Rear, LB5Z-7824630-B	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 899.17	\$ 629.41
2	Pillar Molding, Right, LB5Z-7803144-AA	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 170.52	\$ 119.36
3	Bumper Cover, LB5Z-17D957AAPT	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 728.58	\$ 510.00
4	Window Regulator Right, LB5Z-5827008-A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 160.55	\$ 112.38
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 1,371.15	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		30.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Fordparts.com	
Warranty		No Bid		2 Year	
SECTION 14 - OEM GENERAL MOTORS		<b>Primary Award</b>			
1	Engine Cooling Fan Shroud, 84120130	\$ 99.40	\$ 29.82	No Bid	No Bid
2	Rear Upper Bumper Cover, 84803239	\$ 60,065.00	\$ 180.20	No Bid	No Bid
3	Hood, 85112715	\$ 1,128.70	\$ 338.61	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		\$ 548.63		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		30.00%		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		Catalog Price		No Bid	
Warranty		Website		No Bid	
SECTION 15 - OEM HONDA					
1	Starter Motor Assembly, 31200-PLR-A02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Throttle Body Electronic Control, 16400-59B-003	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Blower Sub Assembly, 79305-TBA-A11	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Wire Harness, Driver Door, 32751-TGG-A10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 13 - OEM FORD					
1	Door Assembly Rear, LB5Z-7824630-B	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Pillar Molding, Right, LB5Z-7803144-AA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Bumper Cover, LB5Z-17D957AAPT	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Window Regulator Right, LB5Z-5827008-A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 14 - OEM GENERAL MOTORS					
1	Engine Cooling Fan Shroud, 84120130	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Rear Upper Bumper Cover, 84803239	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Hood, 85112715	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 15 - OEM HONDA					
1	Starter Motor Assembly, 31200-PLR-A02	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Throttle Body Electronic Control, 16400-59B-003	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Blower Sub Assembly, 79305-TBA-A11	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Wire Harness, Driver Door, 32751-TGG-A10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	



RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Price Sheet Used	No Bid	No Bid
Warranty	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Price Sheet Used	No Bid	No Bid
Warranty	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	<p>Napa Auto Parts                  Fort Worth, TX                  HUB - No                  CO-OP - Yes</p>	<p>XL Parts LLC                  Houston, TX                  HUB - No                  CO-OP - Yes</p>
Price Sheet Used	No Bid	No Bid
Warranty	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 16 - OEM HYUNDAI					
1	Trans Cooler, 25620-1U500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Heat Shield, 31220-C2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Separator, 97206-C2000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Lap & Shoulder Belt, 88810-C2000-PPB	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 17 - OEM TOYOTA					
1	Cruise Control Switch, 8463208021	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Door Lock Switch, 849300C010	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Deck Lid Release Cable, 6460702330	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	A/C Compressor, 8831002852	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 18 - PERMATEX		<i>Secondary Award</i>		<b>Primary Award</b>	
1	Thread Locker 0.20 oz, Single Tube, 24200	\$ 12.96	\$ 5.18	\$ 9.44	\$ 4.72
2	Silicone Brake Parts Lubricant, 8 oz, Single Canister, 80653	\$ 53.64	\$ 21.46	\$ 45.48	\$ 22.74
3	Silicone Gasket Maker, 0.5 oz, Single Tube, 82180	\$ 17.17	\$ 6.87	\$ 12.51	\$ 6.26
4	Silicone Gasket Maker, 0.5 oz, Single Tube, 82194	\$ 19.30	\$ 7.72	\$ 14.06	\$ 7.03
Section Total		\$ 41.23		\$ 40.75	
Discount From List Price		60.00%		50.00%	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
SECTION 16 - OEM HYUNDAI			
1	Trans Cooler, 25620-1U500	No Bid	No Bid
2	Heat Shield, 31220-C2500	No Bid	No Bid
3	Separator, 97206-C2000	No Bid	No Bid
4	Lap & Shoulder Belt, 88810-C2000-PPB	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid	No Bid
Discount From List Price		No Bid	No Bid
Price Sheet Used		No Bid	No Bid
Warranty		No Bid	No Bid
SECTION 17 - OEM TOYOTA			
1	Cruise Control Switch, 8463208021	No Bid	No Bid
2	Door Lock Switch, 849300C010	No Bid	No Bid
3	Deck Lid Release Cable, 6460702330	No Bid	No Bid
4	A/C Compressor, 8831002852	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid	No Bid
Discount From List Price		No Bid	No Bid
Price Sheet Used		No Bid	No Bid
Warranty		No Bid	No Bid
SECTION 18 - PERMATEX			
1	Thread Locker 0.20 oz, Single Tube, 24200	No Bid	No Bid
2	Silicone Brake Parts Lubricant, 8 oz, Single Canister, 80653	No Bid	No Bid
3	Silicone Gasket Maker, 0.5 oz, Single Tube, 82180	No Bid	No Bid
4	Silicone Gasket Maker, 0.5 oz, Single Tube, 82194	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid	No Bid
Discount From List Price		No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 16 - OEM HYUNDAI					
1	Trans Cooler, 25620-1U500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Heat Shield, 31220-C2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Separator, 97206-C2000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Lap & Shoulder Belt, 88810-C2000-PPB	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 17 - OEM TOYOTA					
1	Cruise Control Switch, 8463208021	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Door Lock Switch, 849300C010	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Deck Lid Release Cable, 6460702330	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	A/C Compressor, 8831002852	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 18 - PERMATEx				Alternate Award	
1	Thread Locker 0.20 oz, Single Tube, 24200	\$ 15.84	\$ 7.92	\$ 11.53	\$ 5.53
2	Silicone Brake Parts Lubricant, 8 oz, Single Canister, 80653	\$ 42.08	\$ 21.04	\$ 45.38	\$ 21.78
3	Silicone Gasket Maker, 0.5 oz, Single Tube, 82180	\$ 19.38	\$ 9.69	\$ 17.72	\$ 8.51
4	Silicone Gasket Maker, 0.5 oz, Single Tube, 82194	\$ 19.28	\$ 9.64	\$ 17.71	\$ 8.50
Section Total		\$ 48.29		\$ 44.32	
Discount From List Price		50.00%		52.00%	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Price Sheet Used	<i>Parts Authority Price List</i>	<b>Catalog Price</b>
Warranty	<i>Manufacturer</i>	<b>Manufacturer</b>

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Price Sheet Used	No Bid	No Bid
Warranty	No Bid	No Bid



RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	<p>Napa Auto Parts                  Fort Worth, TX                  HUB - No                  CO-OP - Yes</p>	<p>XL Parts LLC                  Houston, TX                  HUB - No                  CO-OP - Yes</p>
Price Sheet Used	Napa	Permatex
Warranty	No Warranty	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 19 - TIMKEN		<b>Primary Award</b>			
1	Rear Wheel Seal, 8835S	\$ 12.33	\$ 2.71	No Bid	No Bid
2	Front Wheel Bearing and Hub Assembly, SP500301	\$ 838.68	\$ 184.51	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		\$ 187.22		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		78.00%		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		Parts Authority Price List		No Bid	
Warranty		Manufacturer		No Bid	
SECTION 20 - WAGNER				<b>Primary Award</b>	
1	Rear Brake Rotor, BD126457E	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 250.80	\$ 75.24
2	Front Disc Brake Rotor, BD180409E	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 308.50	\$ 92.55
3	Front Disc Brake Rotor, BD180535E	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 294.31	\$ 88.29
4	Rear Brake Rotor, BD126457E	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 250.80	\$ 75.24
5	Brake Pads, OEX1083	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 166.61	\$ 49.98
6	Brake Pads, OEX1612	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 190.47	\$ 57.14
7	Brake Pads, OEX967A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 166.61	\$ 49.98
8	Brake Pads, SX1084	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 188.42	\$ 56.53
9	Brake Pads, SX1363	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 177.40	\$ 53.22
10	Brake Pads, SX1399	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 208.94	\$ 62.68
11	Brake Pads, SX1400	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 187.13	\$ 56.14
12	Brake Pads, SX1707	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 172.94	\$ 51.88
13	Brake Pads, SX931	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 171.83	\$ 51.55
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 820.42	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		70.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Catalog Price	
Warranty		No Bid		Manufacturer	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 19 - TIMKEN					
1	Rear Wheel Seal, 8835S	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Front Wheel Bearing and Hub Assembly, SP500301	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 20 - WAGNER					
1	Rear Brake Rotor, BD126457E	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Front Disc Brake Rotor, BD180409E	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Front Disc Brake Rotor, BD180535E	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Rear Brake Rotor, BD126457E	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Brake Pads, OEX1083	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Brake Pads, OEX1612	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Brake Pads, OEX967A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Brake Pads, SX1084	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Brake Pads, SX1363	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Brake Pads, SX1399	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Brake Pads, SX1400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Brake Pads, SX1707	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Brake Pads, SX931	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 19 - TIMKEN				<i>Secondary Award</i>	
1	Rear Wheel Seal, 8835S	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.19	\$ 3.77
2	Front Wheel Bearing and Hub Assembly, SP500301	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 550.77	\$ 203.78
Section Total		No Bid		\$ 207.55	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		63.00%	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		Timken	
Warranty		No Bid		Varies	
SECTION 20 - WAGNER					
1	Rear Brake Rotor, BD126457E	\$ 131.52	\$ 55.17	No Bid	No Bid
2	Front Disc Brake Rotor, BD180409E	\$ 131.52	\$ 55.17	No Bid	No Bid
3	Front Disc Brake Rotor, BD180535E	\$ 131.52	\$ 55.17	No Bid	No Bid
4	Rear Brake Rotor, BD126457E	\$ 131.52	\$ 55.17	No Bid	No Bid
5	Brake Pads, OEX1083	\$ 88.16	\$ 36.99	No Bid	No Bid
6	Brake Pads, OEX1612	\$ 88.16	\$ 36.99	No Bid	No Bid
7	Brake Pads, OEX967A	\$ 88.16	\$ 36.99	No Bid	No Bid
8	Brake Pads, SX1084	\$ 184.60	\$ 77.44	No Bid	No Bid
9	Brake Pads, SX1363	\$ 160.42	\$ 67.30	No Bid	No Bid
10	Brake Pads, SX1399	\$ 262.68	\$ 110.19	No Bid	No Bid
11	Brake Pads, SX1400	\$ 252.62	\$ 105.97	No Bid	No Bid
12	Brake Pads, SX1707	\$ 150.56	\$ 63.16	No Bid	No Bid
13	Brake Pads, SX931	\$ 153.50	\$ 64.39	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		\$ 820.10		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		58.05%		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		Napa		No Bid	
Warranty		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 21 - WIX				Primary Award	
1	Cabin Air Filter, 24068	\$ 28.00	\$ 5.88	\$ 24.90	\$ 5.47
2	Cabin Air Filter, 24211	\$ 38.70	\$ 8.13	\$ 66.42	\$ 14.58
3	Cabin Air Filter, 24579	\$ 38.64	\$ 8.11	\$ 33.20	\$ 7.29
4	Air Filter, 42488	\$ 39.26	\$ 8.24	\$ 53.94	\$ 11.84
5	Air Filter, 42725	\$ 43.85	\$ 9.21	\$ 62.30	\$ 13.67
6	Air Filter, 46930	\$ 53.48	\$ 11.23	\$ 94.77	\$ 20.80
7	Air Filter, 46935	\$ 25.09	\$ 5.27	\$ 37.38	\$ 8.20
8	Air Filter, 49883	\$ 31.14	\$ 6.54	\$ 49.80	\$ 10.93
9	Oil Filter, 51060	\$ 10.14	\$ 2.13	\$ 16.62	\$ 3.65
10	Oil Filter, 51348	\$ 7.22	\$ 1.52	\$ 16.62	\$ 3.65
11	Oil Filter, 51394	\$ 7.22	\$ 1.52	\$ 16.62	\$ 3.65
12	Oil Filter, 51551	\$ 42.14	\$ 8.89	\$ 26.94	\$ 5.91
13	Oil Filter, 57045	\$ 7.22	\$ 1.52	\$ 16.62	\$ 3.65
14	Oil Filter, 57060	\$ 7.22	\$ 1.52	\$ 16.62	\$ 3.65
15	Oil Filter, 57173	\$ 15.57	\$ 3.27	\$ 16.62	\$ 3.65
16	Oil Filter, 57502	\$ 7.22	\$ 1.52	\$ 16.62	\$ 3.65
17	Oil Filter, 57620	\$ 14.17	\$ 2.98	\$ 28.88	\$ 6.34
18	Oil Filter, 57899	\$ 7.78	\$ 1.63	\$ 16.62	\$ 3.65
19	Cabin Air Filter, WA10414	\$ 38.81	\$ 8.15	\$ 66.42	\$ 14.58
20	Cabin Air Filter, WP10129	\$ 31.47	\$ 6.61	\$ 41.48	\$ 9.10
21	Cabin Air Filter, WP10322	\$ 39.03	\$ 8.20	\$ 58.12	\$ 12.76
Section Total		\$ 112.07		\$ 170.67	
Discount From List Price		79.00%		78.05%	
Price Sheet Used		Parts Authority Price List		Wix Catalog Price	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 21 - WIX					
1	Cabin Air Filter, 24068	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Cabin Air Filter, 24211	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Cabin Air Filter, 24579	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Air Filter, 42488	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Air Filter, 42725	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Air Filter, 46930	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Air Filter, 46935	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Air Filter, 49883	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Oil Filter, 51060	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Oil Filter, 51348	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Oil Filter, 51394	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Oil Filter, 51551	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Oil Filter, 57045	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Oil Filter, 57060	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Oil Filter, 57173	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	Oil Filter, 57502	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Oil Filter, 57620	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Oil Filter, 57899	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Cabin Air Filter, WA10414	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	Cabin Air Filter, WP10129	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Cabin Air Filter, WP10322	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		No Bid		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		No Bid		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

		Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
SECTION 21 - WIX		<i>Secondary Award</i>			
1	Cabin Air Filter, 24068	\$ 26.62	\$ 6.66	No Bid	No Bid
2	Cabin Air Filter, 24211	\$ 71.16	\$ 17.79	No Bid	No Bid
3	Cabin Air Filter, 24579	\$ 35.56	\$ 8.89	No Bid	No Bid
4	Air Filter, 42488	\$ 57.78	\$ 14.45	No Bid	No Bid
5	Air Filter, 42725	\$ 66.70	\$ 16.68	No Bid	No Bid
6	Air Filter, 46930	\$ 88.34	\$ 22.09	No Bid	No Bid
7	Air Filter, 46935	\$ 40.00	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid
8	Air Filter, 49883	\$ 53.32	\$ 13.33	No Bid	No Bid
9	Oil Filter, 51060	\$ 17.76	\$ 4.44	No Bid	No Bid
10	Oil Filter, 51348	\$ 17.76	\$ 4.44	No Bid	No Bid
11	Oil Filter, 51394	\$ 17.76	\$ 4.44	No Bid	No Bid
12	Oil Filter, 51551	\$ 25.12	\$ 6.28	No Bid	No Bid
13	Oil Filter, 57045	\$ 17.76	\$ 4.44	No Bid	No Bid
14	Oil Filter, 57060	\$ 17.76	\$ 4.44	No Bid	No Bid
15	Oil Filter, 57173	\$ 17.76	\$ 4.44	No Bid	No Bid
16	Oil Filter, 57502	\$ 17.76	\$ 4.44	No Bid	No Bid
17	Oil Filter, 57620	\$ 26.92	\$ 6.73	No Bid	No Bid
18	Oil Filter, 57899	\$ 17.76	\$ 4.44	No Bid	No Bid
19	Cabin Air Filter, WA10414	\$ 71.12	\$ 17.78	No Bid	No Bid
20	Cabin Air Filter, WP10129	\$ 44.36	\$ 11.09	No Bid	No Bid
21	Cabin Air Filter, WP10322	\$ 62.26	\$ 15.57	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total		\$ 202.86		No Bid	
Discount From List Price		75.00%		No Bid	
Price Sheet Used		Napa		No Bid	

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Warranty	Manufacturer	<b>Manufacturer</b>



RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	<p>AutoNation Chevrolet          North Richland Hills, TX          HUB - No          CO-OP - Yes</p>	<p>AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth          Fort Worth, TX          HUB - No          CO-OP - Yes</p>
Warranty	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	<p>Napa Auto Parts                  Fort Worth, TX                  HUB - No                  CO-OP - Yes</p>	<p>XL Parts LLC                  Houston, TX                  HUB - No                  CO-OP - Yes</p>
Warranty	<i>No Bid</i>	No Bid

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	Parts Authority, LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Moorestown, NJ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Additional Brand Discounts Offered				
Brand / Discount	AC Delco	62%	Auto Extra Drums & Rotors	65%
Brand / Discount	Bosch	66%	Fel-Pro	60%
Brand / Discount	Cardone	65%	Monroe Shocks & Struts	57%
Brand / Discount	Centric	61%	Motorad	65%
Brand / Discount	Denso	30%	Standard	64%
Brand / Discount	Dorman	65%	Wagner Lighting	65%
Brand / Discount	GPD	64%	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	KYB	64%	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	Mahle	72%	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	Monroe	60%	No Bid	No Bid

Notes: Responses from O'Reilly Auto Parts and Alternator Service Inc. deemed non-responsive for failing to sign addendum 1 as required. AutoNation Chevrolet response for Section 7 & 20, Napa Auto Parts response for Sections 7 & 20 did not meet specifications for failing to bid all items in a section. Parts Authority response for Section 3, 7, 9 & 21 did not meet specifications for bidding items outside of the brand specified in the bid.

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	AutoNation Chevrolet North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		AutoNation Ford South Fort Worth Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Additional Brand Discounts Offered				
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Notes: Responses from O'Reilly Auto Parts and Alternator Service Inc. deemed non-responsive for failing to sign addendum 1 as required. AutoNation Chevrolet response for Section 7 & 20, Napa Auto Parts response for Sections 7 & 20 did not meet specifications for failing to bid all items in a section. Parts Authority response for Section 3, 7, 9 & 21 did not meet specifications for bidding items outside of the brand specified in the bid.

RFB 2022-211 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

	Napa Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Additional Brand Discounts Offered				
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	Catco Exhaust	50%
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	Centric	50%
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	Denso	50%
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	Felpro	50%
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	FCS	50%
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	GSP	50%
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	KYB	50%
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	Pronto	50%
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	Pure Energy	50%
Brand / Discount	No Bid	No Bid	MevoTech	50%

Notes: Responses from O'Reilly Auto Parts and Alternator Service Inc. deemed non-responsive for failing to sign addendum 1 as required. AutoNation Chevrolet response for Section 7 & 20, Napa Auto Parts response for Sections 7 & 20 did not meet specifications for failing to bid all items in a section. Parts Authority response for Section 3, 7, 9 & 21 did not meet specifications for bidding items outside of the brand specified in the bid.